
BID OPENING RESULTS

PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

Grader Blades, Snow Plow Blades, Grader Scarifier Blades and Scarifier Bits for 2016

Bid No. 15-73

Bid Opening Date:  January 07, 2016

Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Grader Blades, 3/4" x 8" x 7', 3/4" dia. bolt 

hole, standard highway punch, through-

hardened Each 10 No Bid $92.60 $926.00 No Bid $92.93 $929.30 No Bid

Brand Bid

Delivery Date

Warranty

Grader Blades, Curved Carbide Insert with 

Carbide Overlay - (20) 3/4" x 6" x 4' & (20) 

3/4" x 6" x 3', 5/8" dia. bolt hole (1 set to 

include 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 4' & 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 3') Sets 11 No Bid No Bid $1,080.05 *$11,880.55 $1,092.64 $12,019.04 No Bid

Brand Bid

Delivery Date

Warranty

Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blade End 

Protector, 2 Blot design for standard duty 

and heavy duty systems, 5/8" diameter 

bolt hole, standard highway punch 

Kennametal - Part # KCWB-0348 (Right 

Hand End Protector) and KCWB-0349 

(Left Hand End Protector) or equivalent, (1 

set to include:  1 - Right Hand End 

Protector and 1 - Left Hand End Protector) Sets 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $622.76 $1,868.28 $471.00 $1,413.00

Brand Bid

Delivery Date

Warranty

Stinger Scarifier Bits, Max Duty Bit 

w/Barbed, Short Retainer (Kennometal - 

Part #C-87KCSB-SR or Equivalent) Each 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38 $3,114.00 $11.47 $3,441.00

Brand Bid

Delivery Date

Warranty

Snow Plow Blades Carbide Insert (1.5" 

gauge) - (20) 3/4" x 6" x 3' & (10) 3/4" x 6" 

x 4', 5/8" dia. Bolt hole, standard highway 

punch (1 set to include 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 3' & 

1 - 3/4" x 6" x 4') Sets 10 No Bid No Bid $620.00 $6,200.00 $506.35 $5,063.50 $494.00 $4,940.00

Brand Bid

Delivery Date

Warranty

* Low bidder did not bid curved blade as required.

Note:  This bid has been awarded to the highlighted vendors above.  

Against Breakage & Defects in 

Material & Workmanship

Black Cat Blades

Valk Manufacturing Co.

New Kingstown, PA  17072

10 Days ARO

Against Normal Wear

Kennametal

10 Days ARO

Against Normal Wear

Kennametal/MHL Systems

15 Days ARO

MHL Warranty Against Normal Wear

Kennametal

3 Weeks ARO

Against Breakage & Defects in 

Material & Workmanship

Bucyrus Blades

5 Weeks ARO

Against Defects in Materials & 

Workmanship

Against Breakage & Defects in 

Material & Workmanship

Kennametal

4 Weeks ARO

MHL Systems

33 E. Columbia Ave.

Salt Lake City, UT  84107

Wear Parts & Equipment Co., Inc.

20100 E. 35th Drive

Aurora, CO  80011

Unconditionally Guaranteed Against 

Breakage

21-Jan-16

Bucyrus Blades

Stock Item

Against Breakage & Defects in 

Material & Workmanship

Bucyrus Blades

Stock Item

Pueblo, CO  81008

Winter Equipment Co., Inc.

Willoughby, OH  44094

2225 N. I-25

Wagner Equipment Co.

Winter Roadmaxx System (Blades not 

Curved)

1900 Joseph Lloyd Pwky

Against Manufacturer Defects

Winter CB3031522 & CF3041522

14 - 21 Days ARO

Against Manufacturer Defects

P. O. Box 428

Caterpillar 7D1577 (Curved)

14 - 21 Days ARO
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