

PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

Grader Blades, Scarifer Bits and Snow Plow Bites
 Bid No. 19-03

BID OPENING RESULTS

Bid Opening Date: February 11, 2019
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Winter Equipment Company, Inc. 1900 Joseph Lloyd Parkway Willoughby, OH 44094	Wear Parts & Equipment Co., Inc. 20100 E. 35th Drive Aurora, CO 80011	Valk Manufacturing Company P.O. Box 428, 66 E. Main Street New Kingstown, PA 17072	DMC Wear Parts 623 Lowrel Avenue Saint Paul, MN 55104	4 Rivers Equipment 685 E. Enterprise Drive Pueblo West, CO 81007
---	---	--	---	--

DESCRIPTION	UNIT	APPROX. QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Grader Blades, (2) 3/4" x 6" x 4", (2) 3/4" x 6" x 3", 3/4" diameter bolt hold (1 set to include 2-3/4" x 6" x 4" and 2-3/4" x 6 x 3)	Set	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,005.60	\$1,005.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,409.39	\$1,409.39
Brand Bid			No Bid		Bucyrus Blades		No Bid		No Bid		Black Cat Blades	
Delivery Date			No Bid		In Stock (Subject to prior sales)/3weeks back order lead time . Delivered 2-3 days after receiving order		No Bid		No Bid		6-8 Weeks ARO	
Warranty			No Bid		Warranty against faulty workmanship.defective material		No Bid		No Bid		Lifetime against workmanship & defects	
Grader Blades, Curved Carbide Insert with Carbide Overlay - (22) 3/4" x 6" x 4' & (22) 3/4" x 6" x 3', 5/8" dia. bolt hole (1 set to include 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 4' & 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 3')	Sets	11	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,005.60	\$11,061.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,409.39	\$15,503.29
Brand Bid			No Bid		Bucyrus Blades		No Bid		No Bid		Black Cat Blades	
Delivery Date			No Bid		In Stock (Subject to prior sales)/3weeks back order lead time . Delivered 2-3 days after receiving order		No Bid		No Bid		6-8 Weeks ARO	
Warranty			No Bid		Warranty against faulty workmanship.defective material		No Bid		No Bid		Lifetime against workmanship & defects	
Stinger Scarifier Bits, Max Duty Bit w/Barbed, Short Retainer (Kennometal - Part #C-87KCSB-SR or Equivalent)	Each	300	Bid Withdrawn	Bid Withdrawn	\$10.38	\$3,114.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.58	\$3,474.00	\$9.62	\$2,886.00
Brand Bid			Sandvik-MT50016		Black Cat Wear Parts		No Bid		DMC - C87-KCSBR		Black Cat Blades	
Delivery Date			Didn't provide information		2 Weeks after receiving order		No Bid		7 Days ARO		6-8 Weeks ARO	
Warranty			Didn't provide information		Warranty against faulty workmanship.defective material		No Bid		Attached		Lifetime against workmanship & defects	
Comment			\$11.26 per box of 40 tools; 320 total tools									
Snow Plow Blades Carbide Insert (1.5" gauge) - (20) 3/4" x 6" x 3' & (10) 3/4" x 6" x 4', 5/8" dia. Bolt hole, standard highway punch (1 set to include 2 - 3/4" x 6" x 3' & 1 - 3/4" x 6" x 4')	Sets	5	\$806.10	\$4,030.50	\$547.55	\$2,737.75	\$456.90	\$2,284.50	\$583.61	\$2,918.05	\$591.13	\$2,955.65
Brand Bid			Witner Equip. CB3031522 (10), CB3041522 (5)		Bucyrus Blades		Valk		Nordik		Black Cat Blades	
Delivery Date			35 days ARO		In Stock (Subject to prior sales)/3weeks back order lead time . Delivered 2-3 days after receiving order		45-90 days ARO		30 days ARA		6-8 Weeks ARO	
Warranty			Products are free from manufacturing defects - see warranty attached		Warranty against faulty workmanship.defective material		1 Year		Attached		Lifetime against workmanship & defects	

Note: This bid has been awarded to the highlighted vendors above.