
BID OPENING RESULTS

PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

Towing Services

Bid No. 20-27

Tom's Towing & Recovery, Inc. Anytime Towing LLC

Bid Opening Date:  October 29, 2020 300 N. Vision Lane 1184 29 1/4 Lane

Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT Pueblo, CO  81001 Pueblo, CO  81006

DESCRIPTION BID PRICE BID PRICE

Flat rate, one way loaded, wrecker fee for Class 1 & 2 

Light Duty vehicles per tow within 12-mile radius. Pick up 

on roadway / road shoulder / driveway / parking area $75.00 $65.00

The flat rate includes all mileage fees and other charges. 

Loaded 2 ways, pick up at shop address, travel to disabled 

vehicle location. Exchange vehicles and return to shop 

address $140.00 $120.00

Flat rate, one way loaded, wrecker fee for Class 3, 4 & 5 

Medium Duty vehicle per tow within 12-mile radius. Pick 

up on roadway / road shoulder / driveway / parking area No Bid $85.00

The flat rate includes all mileage fees and other charges. 

Loaded 2 ways, pick up at shop address, travel to disabled 

vehicle location. Exchange vehicles and return to shop 

address No Bid $160.00

Flat rate, one way loaded, wrecker fee for Class 6, 7 & 8 

Light Heavy- and Heavy-Duty vehicle per tow within 12-

mile radius. Pick up on roadway / road shoulder / driveway 

/ parking area $190.00 No Bid

The flat includes all mileage fees and other charges. 

Loaded 2 ways, pick up at shop address, travel to disabled 

vehicle location. Exchange vehicles and return to shop 

address $350.00 No Bid

Flat Rate, one way loaded, Wrecker fee for heavy 

equipment and off-road equipment, typically used in road 

construction and maintenance, within 12-mile radius. Pick 

up on roadway / road shoulder / driveway / parking area. 

The flat rate includes all mileage fees and other charges. $190.00 No Bid

Light $95.00 $75.00

Medium No Bid $175.00

Heavy $190.00 No Bid

Mileage is determined by a one-way towing mile on any

tow outside of the 12-mile radius. A one-way towing mile

is that mileage from where the vehicle to be towed is

located to the final destination. Mileage charge per tow

mile is Light = $2.50; Heavy = $5.50 $4.00 (Medium Only)

Note:  This bid has been awarded to the highlighted vendors above.  

Winch out or recovery only hourly charge per wrecker or eqiupment used:
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