

**BID OPENING RESULTS**

Bid Opening Date: January 27, 2021  
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc. 20100 E. 35th Drive Aurora, CO 80011	DMC Wear Parts 2414 Inglewood Ave. N Minneapolis, MN 55405	Valk Manufacturing Company PO Box 428, 66 East Main Street New Kingstown, PA 17072	Severson Supply & Rental 2453 West First Street Craig, CO 81625	4 Rivers Equipment 685 E. Enterprise Drive Pueblo West, CO 81007	Power Motive Corp. 5000 Vasquez Blvd. Denver, CO 80216
---	--	--	---	--	--

DESCRIPTION	UNIT	APPROX. QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
Grader Blades, Curved Insert with Carbide Overlay, 5/8" diameter bolt hole, as per Specifications	Sets	9	\$1,186.37	\$10,677.33	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$988.64	11 Per Set (\$10,875.04)	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,188.51	\$10,696.59	
Brand Bid			Bucyrus Blads		No Bid			No Bid		ESCO/BUCYRUS		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited		
Delivery Date			1 week ARO (in stock)		No Bid			No Bid		5 Weeks ARO		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO		
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		No Bid			No Bid		See ESCO warranty documentation		No Bid		Breakage on Heat treated product		
Grader Blades, 3/4"x8"x7', 5/8" diameter bolt hole, as per Specifications	Sets	50	\$100.21	\$5,010.50	No Bid		No Bid	\$105.00	\$5,250.00	\$142.56	\$7,128.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$99.79	\$4,989.50	
Brand Bid			Black Cat Wear Parts		No Bid			Valk		ESCO/BUCYRUS		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited		
Delivery Date			1 week ARO (in Stock)		No Bid			30-60 days ARO		3 weeks A.R.O		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO		
Warranty			vs. breakage during normal usage		No Bid			See attached warranty policy		See ESCO warranty Documentation		No Bid		Breakage on heat treated product		
					<b>Option 1</b>	<b>Option 2</b>	<b>Option 1 Total</b>	<b>Option 2 Total</b>				<b>720 Quantity (Boxes contain 40 bits)</b>				
Stinger Scarifier Bits as per Specifications	Each	700	\$8.94	\$6,258.00	\$14.66	\$8.58	\$10,262.00	\$6,006.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.39	\$12,173.00	\$11.50	\$8,280.00	\$10.05	\$7,035.00
Brand Bid			Black Cat Wear Parts		Kennametal	GATR (Equivalent)	Kennametal	GATR (Equivalent)	No Bid		Kennametal		ITR		Valley Blades Limited	
Delivery Date			2 weeks ARO		10 days from order	10 days from order	10 days from order	10 days from order	No Bid		450 pc's 1 Week A.R.O.; remaining 250 5 weeks A.R.O.		10-14 Days from acceptance of bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO	
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		Kennametal Warranty attached	GATR: defective raw material and breakage during normal application	Kennametal Warranty attached	GATR: defective raw material and breakage during normal application	No Bid		see attached Kennametal Documentation		Lifetime from defects from workmanship		Breakage on heat treated product	
Snow Plow Blades Carbide Insert 5/8" diameter bolt hole as per Specifications	Sets	10	\$478.02	\$4,780.20	\$461.59		\$4,615.90		\$533.30	\$5,333.00	\$581.59	\$5,815.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$452.13	\$4,521.30
Brand Bid			Kennametal		PNS			Valk		ESCO/BUCYRUS		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited		
Delivery Date			1 week ARO (in stock)		3 Weeks from order			30-60 days ARO		3 weeks A.R.O.		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO		
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		Products to be free from defects in raw material and workmanship if used for their intended application			See attached warranty policy		see attached warranty documentation		No Bid		Breakage on heat treated product		

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc. 20100 E. 35th Drive Aurora, CO 80011	DMC Wear Parts 2414 Inglewood Ave. N Minneapolis, MN 55405	Valk Manufacturing Company PO Box 428, 66 East Main Street New Kingstown, PA 17072	Severson Supply & Rental 2453 West First Street Craig, CO 81625	4 Rivers Equipment 685 E. Enterprise Drive Pueblo West, CO 81007	Power Motive Corp. 5000 Vasquez Blvd. Denver, CO 80216
---	--	--	---	--	--

DESCRIPTION	UNIT	APPROX. QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Snow Plow Blades - 5/8"x8"x5' as per Specifications	Sets	50	\$60.53	\$3,026.50	\$72.56	\$3,628.00	\$60.00	\$3,000.00	\$66.87	\$3,343.50		\$0.00	\$77.66	\$3,883.00
Brand Bid			Black Cat Wear Parts		PNS		Valk		ESCO/BUCKRUS		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited	
Delivery Date			4 weeks ARO		3 weeks from order		30-60 days		3 weeks A.R.O.		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO	
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		Products to be free from defects in raw material and workmanship if used for their intended application		See attached warranty policy		No Bid		No Bid		Breakage on heat treated product	
Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades - 3/4" diameter bolt hole as per Specifications	Sets	2	\$2,130.71	\$4,261.42	\$2,297.75	\$4,595.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,522.74	\$5,045.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,782.13	\$5,564.26
Brand Bid			Kennametal		Kennametal (with replaceable holders)		No Bid		Kennametal		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited	
Delivery Date			2 weeks ARO		14 days from order		No Bid		2 weeks A.R.O.		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO	
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		Attached		No Bid		See attached Kennametal warranty Documentation		No Bid		Breakage on heat treated product	
Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades - 5/8" diameter bolt hole as per Specifications	Sets	2	\$2,130.71	\$4,261.42	\$2,297.75	\$4,595.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,522.74	\$5,045.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,782.13	\$5,564.26
Brand Bid			Kennametal		Kennametal (with replaceable holders)		No Bid		Kennametal		No Bid		Valley Blades Limited	
Delivery Date			2 weeks ARO		14 days from order		No Bid		2 weeks A.R.O.		No Bid		4 to 6 weeks ARO	
Warranty			vs. poor workmanship and/or defective material		Attached		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		Breakage on heat treated product	