
BID OPENING RESULTS

PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

Grader Blades, Snowplow Blades and Scarifer Bits
Bid No. 22-01

Bid Opening Date:  March 17, 2022
Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Grader Blades     Curved carbide insert with carbide 
overlay --- (22) ¾” x 6” x 4’ and (22) ¾” x 6” x 3’ 5/8” 
diameter bolt hole (1 set to include:  2 – ¾” x 6” x 4’ 
and 2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’) Sets 8 $1,200.00 $9,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,090.68 $8,725.44 No Bid No Bid $1,323.37 $10,586.96 No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid Bucyrus Blades ESCO/BUCYRUS Valley Blades Limited

Delivery Date
1 week ARO (in 
stock) 6 Weeks ARO 8 weeks ARO

Warranty

vs. poor 
workmanship 
and/or defective 
material

See ESCO 
warranty 
documentation

Breakage on Heat 
treated product

Grader Blades Curved carbide insert with carbide 
overlay --- (22) ¾” x 6” x 4’ and (22) ¾” x 6” x 3’ 3/4” 
diameter bolt hole (1 set to include:  2 – ¾” x 6” x 4’ 
and 2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’) Sets 3 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,090.68 $3,272.04 No Bid No Bid $1,257.20 $3,771.60 No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts ESCO/BUCYRUS Valley Blades Limited

Delivery Date
1 week ARO (in 
Stock) 7 weeks A.R.O 8 weeks ARO

Warranty
vs. breakage during 
normal usage

See ESCO 
warranty 
Documentation

Breakage on heat 
treated product

Grader Blades ¾” x 8” x 7’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch, through-hardened Sets 50 $120.75 $6,037.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.36 $7,868.00 $145.77 $7,288.50 $108.76 $5,438.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts ESCO/BUCYRUS ITR Valley Blades Limited

Delivery Date
1 week ARO (in 
Stock) 7 weeks A.R.O 8 weeks ARO

Warranty
vs. breakage during 
normal usage

See ESCO 
warranty 
Documentation

Lifetime from 
defects and 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product

Grader Blades ¾” x 8” x 7’ 3/4” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch, through-hardened Sets 50 $120.75 $6,037.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.97 $8,298.50 $145.77 $7,288.50 $108.76 $5,438.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts ESCO/BUCYRUS Valley Blades Limited

Delivery Date
1 week ARO (in 
Stock) 7 weeks A.R.O 8 weeks ARO

Warranty
vs. breakage during 
normal usage

See ESCO 
warranty 
Documentation

Lifetime from 
defects and 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product

4 Rivers Equipment

685 E. Enterprise Drive

Pueblo West, CO 81007

DMC Wear Parts

2414 Inglewood Ave. N

Minneapolis, MN 55405

Valk Manufacturing Company

PO Box 428, 66 East Main Street

New Kingstown, PA 17072

Power Motive Corp.

5000 Vasquez Blvd.

Denver, CO 80216

MHL Systems

33 East Coloumbia Ave

Salt Lake City, UT 84107

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.

Aurora, CO 80011

20100 E. 35th Drive

Severson Supply & Rental

Craig, CO 81625

2453 West First Street
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BID OPENING RESULTS

Bid No. 22-01

Bid Opening Date:  March 17, 2022
Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

4 Rivers Equipment

685 E. Enterprise Drive

Pueblo West, CO 81007

DMC Wear Parts

2414 Inglewood Ave. N

Minneapolis, MN 55405

Valk Manufacturing Company

PO Box 428, 66 East Main Street

New Kingstown, PA 17072

Power Motive Corp.

5000 Vasquez Blvd.

Denver, CO 80216

MHL Systems

33 East Coloumbia Ave

Salt Lake City, UT 84107

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.

Aurora, CO 80011

20100 E. 35th Drive

Severson Supply & Rental

Craig, CO 81625

2453 West First Street

720 Quantity (Boxes contain 40 bits)

Stinger Scarifier Bits Each 700 $13.60 $9,520.00 $8.88 $6,216.00 No Bid No Bid $12.87 $9,009.00 $14.47 $10,418.40 $12.10 $8,470.00 $12.23 $8,561.00

Max duty bit w/barbed, short retainer Kennametal – 
Part # C-87KCSB-SR) or equivalent Kennametal GTR GTR Kennametal ITR

Valley Blades 
Limited Kennametal

Delivery Date 2 weeks ARO 7-10 days ARO 6 weeks 3 weeks ARO 8 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO

Warranty

vs. poor 
workmanship 

and/or defective 
material

Agaisnt Defective 
raw material and 
breakage under 
normal usage. 

Agaisnt Defective 
raw material and 
breakage under 
normal usage. 

see attached 
Kennametal 

Documentation

Lifetime from 
defects from 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product

Snow Plow Blades - Carbide Insert (1.5” gauge) --- 
(20) ¾” x 6” x 3’ and (10) ¾” x 6” x 4’ 5/8” diameter 
bolt hole, standard highway punch (1 set to include:  
2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’ and 1 – ¾” x 6” x 4’) Sets 10 $670.00 $6,700.00 No Bid $740.00 $7,400.00 $633.84 $6,338.40 $659.02 $6,590.20 $544.21 $5,442.10 $588.60 $5,886.00

Brand Bid Kennametal Valk ESCO/BUCYRUS
Valley Blades 
Limited Kennametal

Delivery Date
1 week ARO (in 
stock) 45 days ARO 3 weeks A.R.O. ETA May 8 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO

Warranty

vs. poor 
workmanship 
and/or defective 
material 1 year

see attached 
warranty 
documentation

Lifetime from 
defects from 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product

Snow Plow Blades - 5/8” x  8” x 5’ 5/8” diameter bolt 
hole, standard highway punch Sets 50 $70.00 $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.32 $4,066.00 $125.79 $6,289.50 $91.47 $4,573.50 $133.30 $6,665.00

Brand Bid
Black Cat Wear 
Parts ESCO/BUCYKRUS ITR

Valley Blades 
Limited Kennametal

Delivery Date 4 weeks ARO 5 Weeks ARO ETA May 8 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO

Warranty

vs. poor 
workmanship 
and/or defective 
material

see attached 
warranty 
documentation

Lifetime from 
defects from 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product

Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades - Standard 
duty --(2) .875” x 5”x 36”(holds 18 bits) Standard 
duty-- (2) .875” x 5”x 48”(holds 24 bits) With 
replaceable toolholder3/4” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch blocks  To fit Max duty bit 
w/barbed, short retainer (Kennometal – Part #C-
87KCSB-SR) or equivalent (1 set to include 2 - 
.875” x 5” x 36” and 2 - .875” x 5” x 48”) Sets 1 $2,180.00 2180 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,020.10 2020.1 $2,812.74 2812.74 $3,441.79 3441.79 $1,977.85 1977.85

Brand Bid Kennametal Kennametal
Valley Blades 
Limited Kennametal
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BID OPENING RESULTS

Bid No. 22-01

Bid Opening Date:  March 17, 2022
Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

4 Rivers Equipment

685 E. Enterprise Drive

Pueblo West, CO 81007

DMC Wear Parts

2414 Inglewood Ave. N

Minneapolis, MN 55405

Valk Manufacturing Company

PO Box 428, 66 East Main Street

New Kingstown, PA 17072

Power Motive Corp.

5000 Vasquez Blvd.

Denver, CO 80216

MHL Systems

33 East Coloumbia Ave

Salt Lake City, UT 84107

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.

Aurora, CO 80011

20100 E. 35th Drive

Severson Supply & Rental

Craig, CO 81625

2453 West First Street

Delivery Date 2 weeks ARO 2 weeks A.R.O. 3 Weeks ARO 8 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO

Warranty

vs. poor 
workmanship 
and/or defective 
material

See attached 
Kennametal 
warranty 
Documentation

Lifetime from 
defects from 
workmanship

Breakage on heat 
treated product
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