

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejoon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	--

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
BINDERS							
1	Basic Round Ring Binder, 1" Letter, Black	Wilson Jones WLJ-368-14NB	Each	No Bid	\$2.71	\$4.52	No Bid
2	Basic Round Ring Binder, 2" Letter, Black	Wilson Jones WLJ-368-44NB	Each	No Bid	\$5.22	\$8.60	No Bid
3	D-Ring View Binder, 1", Black	Universal UNV-20741	Each	No Bid	\$3.77	\$4.20	\$3.91
4	D-Ring View Binder, 1", White	Universal UNV-20742	Each	No Bid	\$3.71	\$4.61	\$3.84
5	D-Ring View Binder, 1.5", Black	Universal UNV-20743	Each	No Bid	\$4.40	\$5.49	\$4.01
6	D-Ring View Binder, 1.5", White	Universal UNV-20744	Each	No Bid	\$4.34	\$5.49	\$3.94
7	D-Ring View Binder, 2", Black	Universal UNV-20745	Each	No Bid	\$4.94	\$6.39	\$5.23
8	D-Ring View Binder, 2", White	Universal UNV-20746	Each	No Bid	\$4.94	\$6.39	\$5.23
9	D-Ring View Binder, 3", Black	Universal UNV-20747	Each	No Bid	\$6.42	\$8.20	\$6.23
10	D-Ring View Binder, 3", White	Universal UNV-20748	Each	No Bid	\$6.42	\$8.20	\$5.97
11	Twin Pocket Portfolio w/3 Tang Fasteners, Red	Oxford OXF-57711	25/Box	\$32.36	\$17.24	\$17.30	\$17.65
12	Twin Pocket Portfolio w/3 Tang Fasteners, Teal	Oxford OXF-57755	25/Box	\$18.76	\$18.76	\$30.48	\$17.64
13	Two-Pocket Letter Portfolio w/o Fasteners, Teal	Smead SMD-87867	25/Box	No Bid	\$13.31	\$19.26	\$14.31
MESSAGE PADS, RECEIPT BOOKS AND NOTE PADS							
14	Tops Spiralbound Telephone Message Book, 4 per page	Tops TOP-4002	Each	\$8.71	\$4.76	\$8.23	\$4.90
15	Tops Triplicate Carbonless Receipt Book	Tops TOP-46808	Each	\$12.28	\$11.58	\$9.54	\$11.65
16	Wirebound Memo Book, 3 x 5, End Opening, Asst. Colors	National Brand RED-31120	Each	No Bid	\$0.77	\$1.16	\$0.77
17	Wirebound Memo Book, 5 x 3, Side Opening, Asst. Colors	National Brand RED-31220	Each	\$1.40	\$0.77	\$1.16	\$0.77
18	"Post It" Note Pad, 1 1/2 x 2, Yellow	BSN3661	Dozen	\$1.34	\$6.79	\$1.36	\$2.39
19	"Post It" Note Pad, 3 x 3, Yellow	BSN36612	Dozen	\$2.44	\$10.78	\$2.74	\$7.74
20	"Post It" Note Pad, 3 x 5, Yellow	BSN36613	Dozen	\$3.85	\$19.79	\$4.85	\$11.06
21	"Post It" Lined Note Pad, 4 x 6, Yellow	UNV35616	Dozen	\$23.23	\$32.99	\$6.55	\$12.10
22	Evidence Pad, Letter, Yellow	Ampad AMP-20-220	Dozen	No Bid	\$25.24	\$21.44	\$26.25
23	Evidence Pad, Letter, White	Ampad AMP-20-320	Dozen	\$39.00	\$25.24	\$21.44	\$26.25
24	Evidence Pad, Legal Jr., Yellow	Ampad AMP-20-204	Dozen	No Bid	\$17.94	\$27.57	\$23.89
25	Evidence Pad, Legal Jr., White	Ampad AMP-20-304	Dozen	\$13.69	\$16.49	\$27.57	\$23.89
26	Steno Notebook, 6 x 9	National Brand RED-36746	Each	\$3.56	\$1.38	\$1.98	\$1.60
CARDS							
27	Index Cards, 3 x 5, Ruled, White	Oxford ESS-31	100/Pkg.	\$0.50	\$0.74	\$0.61	\$0.81
DISK CASES							
28	Slim-Line CD Jewel Cases	Innovera IVR-85825	25/Pkg.	No Bid	\$7.48	\$12.91	\$7.83
CLIPS & FASTENERS							
29	Binder Clips, 3/4"	UNV10200	12/Box	\$0.24	\$0.90	\$0.25	\$0.34
30	Binder Clips, 1 1/4"	BSN36551	12/Box	\$0.56	\$8.70	\$0.77	\$0.81
31	Binder Clips, 2"	BSN36552	12/Box	\$1.42	\$2.65	\$1.81	\$2.36
32	Paper Clips #1, Regular	BSN65638	1000/PK	\$1.32	\$2.00	\$1.67	\$0.27
33	Paper Clips, Jumbo Regular	BSN65639	1000/PK	\$0.63	\$6.10	\$4.97	\$0.76
34	Self Adhesive Fasteners	Smead SMD-68220	25/Pkg.	\$18.09	\$11.87	\$11.06	\$11.66
CORRECTION FLUID & TAPE							
35	Wite-Out Quick Dry with Foam Applicator, White	Bic BIC-WOFQD324	3/Pkg.	\$2.49	\$3.77	\$4.44	\$3.50
36	Mono Correction Tape, Mini Model	Tombo TOM-68650	Each	No Bid			\$3.14
37	Tombow Mono Correction Tape	Tombo TOM-68620	Each	\$5.80	\$2.28	\$2.12	\$2.40

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejoon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	--

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
ENVELOPES							
38	Kraft Clasp Envelopes, 6 1/2 x 9 1/2	Quality Park QUA-37863	100/Box	\$15.18	\$16.86	\$18.03	\$20.77
39	Kraft Clasp Envelopes, 9 x 12	Quality Park QUA-37890	100/Box	\$15.76	\$16.84	\$8.69	\$16.67
40	Kraft Clasp Envelopes, 10 x 13	Quality Park QUA-37897	100/Box	\$25.72	\$22.73	\$11.06	\$19.95
41	White Catalog Envelopes, 6 x 9	Quality Park QUA-40788	500/Box	No Bid	\$70.04	\$125.86	\$72.54
42	#10 Envelopes, 4 1/8 x 9 1/2, White	Quality Park QUA-CO125	500/Box	\$39.83	\$23.99	\$14.78	No Bid
43	Kraft Interdepartmental Envelopes w/String Fastener, 10 x 13	Quality Park QUA-63560	100/Box	\$44.81	\$56.53	\$91.82	\$55.46
44	Regular White Envelopes, 3 5/8 x 6 1/2	Quality Park QUA-CO105	500/Box	No Bid	\$26.72	\$16.22	No Bid
ERASERS							
45	Click Eraser, Blue with White Disc	Pentel PEN-ZE22C	Each	\$3.81	\$1.25	\$0.92	\$1.26
FILES & TABS							
46	Letter Hanging File Folder, 1/5 Cut, Standard Green	Smead SMD-64055	25/Box	\$13.52	\$14.18	\$11.00	\$12.29
47	Letter File Folder, 1/3 Cut	Smead SMD-10334	100/Box	\$22.40	\$22.64	\$19.80	\$21.72
48	Manila File Jacket, 1 1/2" Expansion, Letter	Esselte ESS-22150	50/Box	\$38.17	\$28.09	\$57.02	\$27.11
49	End Tab Legal Folder w/1 Fastener	Smead SMD-37110	50/Box	\$33.19	\$27.82	\$43.68	\$28.67
50	End Tab Legal Folder w/2 Fasteners	Smead SMD-37115	50/Box	\$49.79	\$38.18	\$36.95	\$44.05
FILE BOXES							
51	R-Kive Storage Box, Legal, Medium Duty, Tie Closure	Bankers Box FEL-00705	12/Crtn.	\$112.87	\$102.01	\$100.81	\$112.52
GLUE							
52	Glue Stick	Avery AVE-00166	Each	\$1.57	\$0.54	\$0.41	\$0.54
INDEX TABS & INSERTS							
53	Plastic Tabs for Hanging File Folders, 1/5 Cut, Clear	Pendaflex ESS-42-CR	25/Pkg.	\$4.97	\$3.20	\$5.16	\$3.11
54	Insertable Indexes, 5-Tabs, 8 1/2 x 11, Multicolor	Wilson Jones WLJ-54309	1 Set/Pkg.	\$1.57	\$1.33	\$2.19	\$1.28
55	Insertable Indexes, 5-Tabs, 8 1/2 x 11, Clear	Wilson Jones WLJ-54310	1 Set/Pkg.	\$2.65	\$2.59	\$1.97	\$2.54
56	Insertable Indexes, 8-Tabs, 8 1/2 x 11, Multicolor	Wilson Jones WLJ-54311	1 Set/Pkg.	\$3.48	\$1.94	\$2.83	\$1.81
57	Printed Message Flag, "Sign Here"	Redi-Tag RTG-81024	120/Pkg.	\$5.64	\$4.34	\$6.50	\$5.09
LABELS							
58	Avery Laser Printer Labels, 1 x 2 5/8, White	Avery AVE-5260	750/Pkg.	\$12.03	\$10.55	\$9.98	\$9.22
59	Avery Laser Printer Labels, 1 x 2 5/8, White	Avery AVE-5160	3000/Box	\$125.76	\$33.74	\$28.38	\$33.41
60	Avery Laser Printer Labels, 1 x 4, White	Avery AVE-5161	2000/Box	\$39.00	\$33.74	\$28.38	\$30.68
MISCELLANEOUS							
61	8" Scissors	Westcott ACM-19018	Each	\$10.20	\$6.07	\$9.22	\$5.67
62	Sortkwik Fingertip Moistener	Lee LEE-10050	Each	\$2.40	\$1.14	\$1.87	\$1.15
63	2-Hole Paper Punch	Swingline SWI-74050	Each	\$20.16	\$16.61	\$16.59	\$21.70
64	3-Hole Paper Punch	Swingline SWI-74020	Each	\$24.06	\$18.78	\$30.46	\$21.70
65	Large Rubber Bands, 7 x 1/8 x 1/16	UNV01117	1# Box	\$10.20	\$4.69	\$3.59	\$2.76
66	Rubber Bands, 3 1/2 x 1/16 x 1/32	BSN1914LB	250/Box	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.64	\$2.10
PAPER							
67	Watermarked Bond, 25% Cotton, 20#, 8 1/2 x 11	SOU403C	500/Box	\$29.87	\$25.46	\$22.12	\$21.31
68	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Minimum 92 Brightness, White	GEN8X11	10/Case	\$35.99	\$58.28	\$41.31	\$43.90
69	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Canary	SPR05122	Ream	\$6.39	\$7.26	\$5.25	\$6.90
70	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Blue	SPR05121	Ream	\$6.39	\$7.26	\$5.25	\$6.90
71	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Green	SPR05123	Ream	\$6.39	\$7.26	\$5.25	\$5.85
72	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Pink	SPR05124	Ream	\$6.39	\$7.27	\$5.25	\$5.85
73	8 1/2 x 11 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Golden Rod	SPR05125	Ream	\$6.39	\$7.25	\$6.22	\$5.85
74	8 1/2 x 14 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Minimum 92 Brightness, White	GPT999706	10/Case	\$78.90	\$82.00	\$59.93	\$90.49
75	11 x 17 OD/Xerographic Paper, 20 lbs., Minimum 92 Brightness, White	GPT999812	5/Case	\$44.65	\$65.20	\$45.28	\$53.17
76	Sheet Protector, Heavy Duty, Top Loading	Avery AVE-74090	50/Box	\$12.69	\$7.13	\$9.96	\$6.26

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	---

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
PENS, PENCILS & MARKERS							
77	Bic Ballpoint, Fine, Black	Bic BIC-GSF11-BK	Dozen	\$0.78	\$1.42	\$0.99	\$1.35
78	Bic Ballpoint, Medium, Black	Bic BIC-GSM11-BK	Dozen	\$0.78	\$1.42	\$0.99	\$1.28
79	Bic Ballpoint, Medium, Blue	Bic BIC-GSM11-BE	Dozen	\$0.78	\$1.42	\$0.99	\$9.50
80	Pentel R.S.V.P. Pen, Fine, Black	Pentel PEN-BK90-A	Dozen	\$8.79	\$9.34	\$5.32	\$8.30
81	Pentel R.S.V.P. Pen, Fine, Blue	Pentel PEN-BK90-C	Dozen	\$8.71	\$9.56	\$5.32	\$8.30
82	Pilot Precise V7 Rollerball Pen, Fine, Black	Pilot PIL-35346	Dozen	\$17.42	\$15.18	\$14.51	\$15.07
83	Pilot Precise V7 Rollerball Pen, Fine, Blue	Pilot PIL-35349	Dozen	\$17.42	\$15.18	\$14.51	\$15.07
84	Pilot Precise V7 Rollerball Pen, Fine, Red	Pilot PIL-35352	Dozen	\$17.42	\$15.18	\$14.51	\$15.07
85	Dry Erase Marker, Fine Point, SAN84074 (Black, Red, Blue & Green)	SAN86074	4/Set	No Bid	\$7.81	\$3.66	No Bid
86	Marks-A-Lot Permanent Marker, Chisel Point, Black	Avery AVE-08888	Dozen	\$7.33	\$8.11	\$6.67	\$8.41
87	Highlighters Set, (Yellow, Orange, Pink, Turquoise, Flr. Yellow & Flr. Green)	Sharpie SAN-25076	6/Set	\$5.87	\$3.96	\$4.83	\$3.73
88	Sharpie Highlighters, Yellow	Sharpie SAN-1754463	Dozen	\$15.18	\$13.32	\$11.33	\$7.62
89	Sharpie Highlighters, Orange	Sharpie SAN-1754466	Each	No Bid	\$13.32	\$20.52	\$7.62
90	Sharpie Highlighters, Flr. Green	Sharpie SAN-1754468	Dozen	\$16.59	\$13.32	\$19.93	\$12.95
91	Sharpie Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Black	Sharpie SAN-30001	Dozen	\$6.48	\$10.76	\$7.78	\$9.84
92	Sharpie Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Red	Sharpie SAN-30002	Dozen	\$6.48	\$10.78	\$7.78	\$9.74
93	Sharpei Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Blue	Sharpie SAN-30003	Dozen	\$6.48	\$10.78	\$7.78	\$9.74
94	Bic Permanent Marker, Ex. Fine Point, Black	Bic BIC-GPMU11-BK	Dozen	\$9.95	\$7.01	\$8.98	\$6.33
95	Bic Permanent Marker, Ex. Fine Point, Red	Bic BIC-GPMU11-RD	Dozen	\$11.03	\$7.24	\$9.01	\$6.33
96	Paper Mate Mechanical Pencil, 0.7mm, Yellow	Paper Mate PAP-3030131	Dozen	\$6.88	\$3.72	\$3.55	\$3.91
97	.07 Mechanical Pencil Lead	732834	90/Pack	\$1.39	\$1.09	\$0.48	\$0.70
98	.05 Mechanical Pencil Lead	732826	90/Pack	\$0.94	\$1.09	\$0.48	\$0.70
RIBBONS - CALCULATOR							
99	Universal Calculator Spool, Red/Black	Dataproducts DPSR3027	Each	\$3.39	\$1.06	\$1.89	\$1.00
RIBBONS/TONER CARTRIDGES - PRINTERS							
BLACK CARTRIDGES - PRINTER							
100	Dell 1320c Laser, Black	Dell DT615	Each	No Bid	\$95.44	\$79.55	No Bid
101	Dell 3110cn, 3115 Laser, Black	Dell PF028	Each	No Bid	\$113.84	\$117.34	No Bid
102	Dell 1720 Series Laser, Black	Dell MW558	Each	\$145.79	\$147.39	\$174.86	No Bid
103	HP DeskJet 820, 855C, 870C, 870CXI, 1120C, 890, 890C, 890CXI, 895, 895C, 895CSE, 895CSI, 895CXI, 1220C, 920C, 932C, 935C, 960C, 970CSE, 970CXI, 990C, 990CSE, 990CXI, 995C, OfficeJet T45XI, G85XI, G95 DesignJet 755CM, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-51645A	Each	\$59.39	\$66.69	\$58.29	\$65.53
104	HP DeskJet 5650, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-C6656AN	Each	\$37.79	\$45.59	\$38.25	\$41.35
105	HP DeskJet 6540, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-C8767WN	Each	\$38.69	No Bid	No Bid	\$55.54
106	HP LaserJet 1300, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q2613X	Each	\$134.09	\$109.25	\$134.13	\$149.47
107	HP LaserJet 1320, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q5949A	Each	\$107.99	\$109.25	\$108.22	\$118.13
108	HP LaserJet 2400, 2430, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q6511A	Each	No Bid	\$142.95	\$48.45	No Bid
109	HP LaserJet 2600 Series, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q6000A	Each	No Bid	\$113.85	\$94.55	No Bid

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejoon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	--

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
110	HP LaserJet 4100, 4100N, (high yield), Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-C8061X	Each	No Bid	\$185.90	\$43.61	No Bid
111	HP LaserJet 4250tn, 4350n, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q5942A	Each	\$194.39	\$185.90	\$195.99	\$213.94
112	HP 80A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF280A	Each	\$107.09	\$118.79	\$107.69	\$120.99
113	HP 90A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE390A	Each	\$182.69	\$199.09	\$180.80	\$203.12
114	HP 305A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE410A	Each	\$78.74	\$101.19	\$88.21	\$98.85
115	HP 304A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CC530A	Each	\$130.49	\$113.85	\$132.44	\$143.94
116	HP 131A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF210A	Each	\$69.29	\$82.79	\$73.16	\$80.35
117	HP 38A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q1338A	Each	\$201.59	\$181.50	\$202.09	\$225.42
118	HP 51A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q7551A	Each	\$152.99	\$130.90	\$155.12	\$172.87
119	HP 12A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q2612A	2-Pkg	\$82.79	\$89.70	\$83.72	\$91.36
120	HP 504A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE250A	Each	\$143.09	\$141.90	\$145.05	\$161.78
121	HP 201X LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF400X	Each	\$93.59	\$110.39	\$97.82	\$107.42
122	HP 26A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF226A	Each	\$119.69	\$133.09	\$120.53	\$135.41
123	HP 83X LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF283X	Each	\$82.79	\$96.59	\$85.48	\$93.88
124	HP 81A LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF281A	Each	\$179.09	\$197.99	\$179.19	\$204.47
125	HP 410X LaserJet, Black	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF410X	Each	\$147.59	\$164.99	\$152.91	\$167.91
COLOR/TRI-COLOR CARTRIDGES - PRINTER							
126	HP DeskJet 1120C, 890, 890C, 890CXI, 895, 895C, 895CSE, 895CSI, 895CXI, OfficeJet T45XI, Color	Hewlett Packard HEW-C1823D	Each	No Bid	\$74.74	\$65.24	No Bid
127	HP DeskJet 1220C, 920C, 935C, 940C, 960C, 970CSE, 970CXI, 990C, 990CSE, 990CXI, 932C, 995C, OfficeJet G85XI, G95, Color	Hewlett Packard HEW-C6578AN	Each	No Bid			
128	HP DeskJet 5650, Color	Hewlett Packard HEW-C6657AN	Each	\$64.79	\$74.44	\$53.19	\$70.22
129	HP DeskJet 6540, Color	Hewlett Packard HEW-C9363WN	Each	\$64.79	\$71.29	\$52.32	\$67.71
CYAN TONER CARTRIDGES - PRINTER							
130	Dell 1320c Laser, Cyan	Dell 310-9060	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$109.28	No Bid
131	HP LaserJet 2600 Series, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q6001A	Each	No Bid	\$113.85	\$103.18	No Bid
132	HP 305A LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE411A	Each	\$125.09	\$126.50	\$121.81	\$140.82

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022
 Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejoon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	--

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
133	HP 304A LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CC531A	Each	\$128.69	\$113.85	\$124.02	\$141.15
134	HP 131A LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF211A	Each	\$89.09	\$103.49	\$87.07	\$100.67
135	HP 504A LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE251A	Each	\$280.79	\$229.90	\$270.55	\$317.67
136	HP 201X LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE401X	Each	\$103.49	\$101.99	\$103.07	No Bid
137	HP 410X LaserJet, Cyan	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF411A	Each	\$114.29	\$127.59	\$194.45	\$129.99
MAGENTA TONER CARTRIDGES - PRINTER							
138	Dell 1320c Laser, Magenta	Dell WM138	Each	\$102.59	\$116.59	\$109.28	No Bid
139	HP LaserJet 2600 Series, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q6003A	Each	No Bid	\$118.00	\$103.18	\$113.50
140	HP 305A LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE413A	Each	\$125.09	\$113.85	\$119.38	\$140.82
141	HP 304A LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CC533A	Each	\$128.69	\$113.85	\$124.02	\$141.15
142	HP 131A LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF213A	Each	\$89.09	\$103.49	\$87.07	\$100.67
143	HP 504A LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE253A	Each	\$280.79	\$229.90	\$270.55	\$317.67
144	HP 201X LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF403X	Each	\$103.49	\$116.59	\$103.07	\$119.17
145	HP 410X LaserJet, Magenta	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF413X	Each	\$197.99	\$219.90	\$194.45	\$224.78
YELLOW TONER CARTRIDGES - PRINTER							
146	Dell 1320c Laser, Yellow	Dell PN124	Each	No Bid	\$124.64	\$94.80	No Bid
147	HP LaserJet 1500 - 2500 Printer, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-C9702A	Each	No Bid	\$42.00	No Bid	No Bid
148	HP LaserJet 2600 Series, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-Q6002A	Each	No Bid	\$113.85	\$103.18	No Bid
149	HP 305A LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE412A	Each	\$125.09	\$126.50	\$119.38	\$140.82
150	HP 304A LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CC532A	Each	\$128.69	\$113.85	\$124.02	\$141.15
151	HP 131A LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF212A	Each	\$89.09	\$103.49	\$87.07	\$100.67
152	HP 504A LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CE252A	Each	\$280.79	\$229.90	\$270.55	\$317.67
153	HP 201X LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF402X	Each	\$103.49	\$116.59	\$103.07	\$119.17
154	HP 410X LaserJet, Yellow	Hewlett Packard HEW-CF412X	Each	\$197.99	\$219.99	\$194.45	\$119.17
RIBBONS/CORRECTION - TYPEWRITERS							
155	IBM Wheelwriter Correctable Ribbon Cassette	Dataproducs DPSR5110	Each	\$8.45	\$4.74	\$7.75	\$4.54
STAPLES, STAPLERS & STAPLE PULLERS							

PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

BID OPENING RESULTS

Office Supplies for 2022

Bid No. - 22-02

Bidder No. 1

Bidder No. 2

Bidder No. 3

Bidder No. 4

Bid Opening Date: March 16, 2022

Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

Quill LLC. 100 Schelter Rd Lincolnshire, IL. 60069	Pacific Star Corporation 4350 Wayside Dr. #106 Houston, TX 77087	Eon Office 60 Tejon St. Denver, CO. 80223	Total Office 931 S. Tejoon St. Colorado Springs, CO. 80903
--	--	---	--

BID NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NO.	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
156	Stapler, Black	Bostitch BOS-B515-BK	Each	\$9.12	\$5.74	\$8.37	\$7.22
157	Staples for Standard Staplers, Chisel Point	BSN65649	5000/Box	\$0.62	\$1.08	\$0.57	\$1.10
158	Staple Puller	Swingline SWI-38101	Each	No Bid	\$3.72	\$4.07	\$3.56
TAPE							
159	Adding Machine Tape, 2 1/4"	176511	Dozen	\$14.88	\$13.92	\$5.16	\$8.79
160	3M Scotch Tape Dispenser, Black	Scotch MMM-C38-BK	Each	\$5.39	\$3.12	\$2.27	\$3.17
161	3M Magic Mending Scotch Tape Refills, 3/4"	Scotch MMM-810K6C38	6/Pkg.	\$16.26	\$15.58	\$12.69	\$15.15
162	3M Scotch Package Sealing Tape, Tear-By-Hand	Scotch MMM-3841	Roll	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.33	No Bid
OPERATING SUPPLIES - BATTERIES							
163	Alkaline Battery, AAA	EVE-E92FP-12	12/Box	No Bid	\$15.95	\$10.45	\$14.05
164	Alkaline Battery, AA	Energizer EVE-E91SBP24H	24/Box	No Bid	\$30.78	\$34.60	\$17.07
165	Alkaline Battery, C	Energizer EVE-E93BP-4	4/Pkg.	No Bid	\$10.36	\$12.58	\$8.07
166	Alkaline Battery, 9V	Energizer EVE-522BP-2	2/Pkg.	No Bid	\$10.36	\$11.31	\$9.85

Note: This bid has been awarded to the high-lighted vendors above.