Bid No. 23-14

BID OPENING RESULTS

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.
20100 E. 35th Drive

Bid Opening Date: April 27, 2023
Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

DMC Wear Parts
3135 Humbolt Ave S

Valk Manufacturing
66 Est Main St

Severson Suuply
2453 West First St

Aurora, CO 80011

Minneopolis, MN 55408

Craig, CO. 81626

PO Bos 428New Kingstown, PA 17072

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Grader Blades  Curved carbide insert with
carbide overlay --- (22) %” x 6” x 4’ and (22) %" x 6”
x 3’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole (1 set to include: 2 — %"
x6"x4 and 2 -3%"x6"x3) Sets 8 $1,100.00 $8,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,044.20 $8,353.60 $0.00 $0.00
Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Bucyrus NO BID
Delivery Date 7 Weeks ARO 6 Weeks ARO

Warranty

Grader Blades Curved carbide insert with carbide
overlay --- (22) %" x 6" x 4’ and (22) %" x 6" x 3’
3/4” diameter bolt hole (1 set to include: 2 — 34" x

See Attached

See Attached

Grader Blades %4” x 8" x 7’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole,

6" x4 and 2 — %" x 6" x 3") Sets 3 $1,100.00 $3,300.00 $1,044.20 $3,132.60 $0.00
Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Bucyrus NO BID

Delivery Date 7 Weeks ARO 6 Weeks ARO

Warranty See Attached See Attached

Warrant

See

tached
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standard highway punch, through-hardened Each 50 $145.58 $7,279.00 $0.00 $0.00 $174.46 $8,723.00 $147.00 $7,350.00
Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts NO BID Bucyrus \Valk
1 week ARO (in
Delivery Date Stock) 5 Weeks ARO 30-45 Days
r
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Bid No. 23-14

Bid Opening Date: April 27, 2023
Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT

BID OPENING RESULTS

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.
20100 E. 35th Drive
Aurora, CO 80011

DMC Wear Parts
3135 Humbolt Ave S
Minneopolis, MN 55408

Severson Suuply
2453 West First St
Craig, CO. 81626

Valk Manufacturing
66 Est Main St
PO Bos 428New Kingstown, PA 17072

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

DESCRIPTION UNIT |QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Grader Blades %" x 8” x 7’ 3/4” diameter bolt hole,
standard highway punch, through-hardened Each 50 $145.58 $7,279.00 $0.00 $0.00 $174.46 $8,723.00 $147.00 $7,350.00
Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts NO BID Bucyrus Valk

1 week ARO (in

Delivery Date Stock) 5 Weeks ARO 30-45 Days
Warranty See attached See Attached 1 year

Stinger Scarifier Bits Each 700 $15.92 $11,144.00 $12.76 $8,932.00 $22.39 $15,673.00 $0.00 $0.00
Max duty bit w/barbed, short retainer Kennametal —

Part # C-87KCSB-SR) or equivalent Kennametal Kennametal NO BID

Delivery Date 2 weeks ARO 1 week ARO 4 weeks ARO

Warranty

Snow Plow Blades - Carbide Insert (1.5” gauge) ---
(20) %" x 6” x 3 and (10) %” x 6” x 4’ 5/8” diameter
bolt hole, standard highway punch (1 set to include:

See attached

See attached

2-%"x6"x3 and 1 —%"x6" x4’) Sets 10 $550.00 $5,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $612.67 $6,126.70 $592.00 $5,920.00
Brand Bid Kennametal "NO BID Bucyrus \Valk
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Bid No. 23-14
BID OPENING RESULTS

Bid Opening Date: April 27, 2023 Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc. DMC Wear Parts Severson Suuply Valk Manufacturing
Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT 20100 E. 35th Drive 3135 Humbolt Ave S 2453 West First St 66 Est Main St
Aurora, CO 80011 Minneopolis, MN 55408 Craig, CO. 81626 PO Bos 428New Kingstown, PA 17072
APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 week ARO (in
Delivery Date Stock) 5 Weeks ARO 45 Days
Warranty See attached See Attached

Snow Plow Blades - 5/8” x 8" x 5’ 5/8” diameter

bolt hole, standard highway punch Each 50 $81.00 $4,050.00 $0.00 $4,448.50 $4,450.00
Black Cat Wear

Brand Bid Parts NO BID Bucyrus \Valk

Delivery Date 2 weeks ARO 5 Weeks ARO 30-45 Days

Warranty See attached See Attached 1 year

Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades - Standard
duty --(2) .875” x 5”’x 36”(holds 18 bits) Standard
duty-- (2) .875” x 5”x 48”(holds 24 bits) With
replaceable toolholder3/4” diameter bolt hole,
standard highway punch blocks To fit Max duty bit
w/barbed, short retainer (Kennometal — Part #C-
87KCSB-SR) or equivalent (1 set to include 2 -

.875” x 5" x 36" and 2 - .875" x 5” x 48”) Sets 1 $2,492.00| $ 2,492.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,157.78 $3,157.7§| $0.00 $0.00]
Brand Bid Kennametal Kennametal Kennametal NO BID
Delivery Date 2 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO 4 weeks ARO
Kennametal
Warranty See attached Warranty See attached
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