
PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

Grader Blades, Snowplow Blades and Scarifer Bits
Bid No. 24-08

Bid Opening Date:  April 2, 2024
Bid Opening Time:  2:00 p.m. MT

APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Grader Blades     Curved carbide insert with carbide 
overlay --- (22) ¾” x 6” x 4’ and (22) ¾” x 6” x 3’ 5/8” 
diameter bolt hole (1 set to include:  2 – ¾” x 6” x 4’ 
and 2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’) Sets 14 $1,180.00 $16,520.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,094.20 $15,318.80 $955.22 $13,373.08 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Esco Valk NO BID NO BID

Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30-60 Days

Warranty See Attached See Attached See Attached

Grader Blades Curved carbide insert with carbide 
overlay --- (22) ¾” x 6” x 4’ and (22) ¾” x 6” x 3’ 3/4” 
diameter bolt hole (1 set to include:  2 – ¾” x 6” x 4’ 
and 2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’) Sets 5 $1,180.00 $5,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,094.20 $5,471.00 $955.22 $4,776.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Esco Valk NO BID NO BID

Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30-60 Days

Warranty See Attached See Attached See Attached

Grader Blades ¾” x 8” x 7’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch, through-hardened Each 60 $145.58 $8,734.80 $143.15 $8,589.00 $169.27 $10,156.20 $143.94 $8,636.40 $153.16 $9,189.60 $143.62 $8,617.20

Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts ITR Esco Valk Nordik Blade ITR

Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO 1 week ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30 Days ARO 4 Weeks

Warranty See attached See Attached See Attached See Attached See attached

Grader Blades ¾” x 8” x 7’ 3/4” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch, through-hardened Each 60 $145.58 $8,734.80 $143.15 $8,589.00 $169.42 $10,165.20 $143.94 $8,636.40 $153.16 $9,189.60 $143.62 $8,617.20

Brand Bid Black Cat Wear Parts ITR Esco Valk Nordik Blade ITR

Delivery Date 1 Week ARO 1 week ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30 Days ARO 4 Weeks

Warranty See attached See Attached See Attached See Attached See attached

Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc.

Aurora, CO 80011
20100 E. 35th Drive

DMC Wear Parts Severson Suuply

Minneopolis, MN 55408 Craig, CO. 81626 PO Bos 428New Kingstown, PA 17072

Valk Manufacturing
3135 Humbolt Ave S 2453 West First St 66 Est Main St

Nordik Blades 4Rivers
451 rue des Batisseurs 685 E. Enterprise Dr.

Val-des-Sources, QC, Canada J1T 4V8Pueblo West, Colorado 81007

ON HAND AT TIME OF BID
LIFETIME FROM DEFECTS

ON HAND AT TIME OF BID
LIFETIME FROM DEFECTS



Stinger Scarifier Bits Each 900 $10.50 $9,450.00 $13.88 $12,492.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11.71 $10,539.00 $15.66 $14,094.00

Max duty bit w/barbed, short retainer Kennametal – 
Part # C-87KCSB-SR) or equivalent Black Cat Wear Parts Betek*BC70 NO BID NO BID Nordik Blade ITR PKG -QTY  920 ea. 

Delivery Date 1 week ARO 1 week ARO 4 Weeks

Warranty See attached Betek*BC70

Alternative:
G87KCSBSR** - $12.74/ea. = $11466.00 
Total
GATR
1-2 week ARO
Warranty against normal breakage
**You have run this brand in 2022,2021 See attached

Snow Plow Blades - Carbide Insert (1.5” gauge) --- 
(20) ¾” x 6” x 3’ and (10) ¾” x 6” x 4’ 5/8” diameter 
bolt hole, standard highway punch (1 set to include:  
2 – ¾” x 6” x 3’ and 1 – ¾” x 6” x 4’) Sets 20 $600.00 $12,000.00 $579.00 $11,580.00 $658.00 $13,160.00 $520.00 $10,400.00 $499.30 $9,986.00 $0.00 $0.00

Brand Bid Kennametal Xcal Xcal Valk Nordik Blade NO BID

Delivery Date 1-2 week ARO 2 weeks ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30-60 Days 4 Weeks

Warranty See attached
Against normal 
breakage See Attached See Attached See attached

Snow Plow Blades - 5/8” x  8” x 5’ 5/8” diameter bolt 
hole, standard highway punch Each 50 $90.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $84.55 $4,227.50 $80.75 $4,037.50 $96.55 $4,827.50 $124.48 $6,224.00

Brand Bid
Black Cat Wear 

Parts NO BID Esco Valk Nordik Blade ITR

Delivery Date 5 weeks ARO
3-4 Weeks 
ARO 30 Days ARO 4 Weeks ETA MAY

Warranty See attached See Attached See Attached See attached

Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades - Standard 
duty --(2) .875” x 5”x 36”(holds 18 bits) Standard 
duty-- (2) .875” x 5”x 48”(holds 24 bits) With 
replaceable toolholder3/4” diameter bolt hole, 
standard highway punch blocks  To fit Max duty bit 
w/barbed, short retainer (Kennometal – Part #C-
87KCSB-SR) or equivalent (1 set to include 2 - 
.875” x 5” x 36” and 2 - .875” x 5” x 48”) Sets 2 $2,540.00  $        5,080.00 $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,735.00 $7,470.00

Brand Bid Kennametal Kennametal NO BID NO BID NO BID John Deere

Delivery Date 3-4 weeks ARO 2 weeks ARO
3-4 WEEKS 
ARO

Warranty See attached
Kennametal 

Warranty

LIFETIME FROM DEFECTS

LIFETIME FROM DEFECTS

LIFETIME FROM DEFECTS

3-4 WEEKS ARO


