PUEBLO COUNTY, COLORADO

2025 Grader Blades, Snowplow Blades and Scarifer Bits

Bid No.25-13

Bid Opening Date: March 27, 2025 Wear Parts & Equip. Co. Inc. DMC Wear Parts Valk Manufacturing Severson Suuply Winter Equipment
Bid Opening Time: 2:00 p.m. MT 20100 E. 35th Drive 3135 Humbolt Ave S 66 Est Main St 2453 West First St 1900 Joseph Lloyd Parkway
Aurora, CO 80011 Minneopolis, MN 55408 PO Bos 428New Kingstown, PA 17072 Craig, CO. 81626 Willoughby, Ohio 44094
APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Grader Blades Curved carbide insert
with carbide overlay --- (36) 34" x 6” x 4’
and (36) %" x 6” x 3’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole
(1settoinclude: 2-%"x6"x4 and 2 —%"
x 6" x 3') Sets 18 $1,117.00 $20,106.00 $0.00 $0.00 $996.10 $17,929.80 $1,089.84 $19,617.12 $1,347.50 $24,255.00
Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Valk Esco Winter EQqupment Roadmax System
Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO (in stock) 45-60 Days 6 Weeks ARO 14-12 days #SYS-RM14NG
Warrant vs flaws in workmanship/materials See Attached Mfg

Grader Blades Curved carbide insert
with carbide overlay --- (16) %" x 6” x 4’
and (16) 34" x 6” x 3’ 3/4” diameter bolt hole
(1 settoinclude: 2-%"x6"x4"and 2 - %"

x 6" x 3') Sets 8 $1,117.00 $8,936.00 $0.00 $0.00 $996.10 $7,968.80 $1,089.84 $8,718.72 $1,347.50 $10,780.00
Brand Bid Bucyrus NO BID Valk Esco Winter Equpment Roadmax System
Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO (in stock) 45-60 Days 6 Weeks ARO 14-21 days #SYS-RM14NG

W t fl i ki hip/ See Attached Mf Included

Stinger Scarifier Bits

Max duty bit w/barbed, short retainer

$21,420.00

Kennametal — Part # C-87KCSB-SR) or
equivalent

Kennametal

GATR NO BID XCAL Winter EQqupment Roadmax System
Buckets of 50 only
Note: Kennametal has
discontinued this item.
Stock is remainder
Delivery Date 1-2 Days ARO only. 5-7 days ARO 6 Weeks ARO 14-21 days #MT50116

gauge) --- (40) %" x 6” x 3’ and (20) %" x 6”
x 4’ 5/8” diameter bolt hole, standard
highway punch (1 set to include: 2 —34" x 6”

Mf

Sold 40/B

x 3 and 1 — %" x 6" x4) Sets 20 $600.00 $12,000.00 $625.00 $12,500.00 $487.30 $9,746.00 $600.77 $12,015.40 $1,314.00 $26,280.00
Brand Bid |[Kennametal XCAL Valk XCAL Winter EQqupment Razor System

Delivery Date 1 week ARO 3-4 weeks ARO - FBO 45-60 Days 6 Weeks ARO 14-21 days #SYS-RZ10CDC

W fl i Against | b See Attached VT

ncluded




Snow Plow Blades - 5/8” x 8" x 5’ 5/8”

$4,9oo.oo||

Kennametal Grader Scarifier Blades -
Standard duty --(2) 5/8” x 5"x 36”(holds 18
bits) Standard duty-- (2) 5/8” x 5"x 48”(holds
24 bits) With replaceable toolholder3/4”
diameter bolt hole, standard highway punch
blocks To fit Max duty bit w/barbed, short
retainer (Kennometal — Part #C-87KCSB-
SR) or equivalent (1 set to include 2 - .875”

diameter bolt hole, standard highway punch [Each 50 $121.81 $6,090.50 $0.00 $0.00 $98.00 $95.54 $4,777.00 $880.83 $44,041.50
Brand Bid [Bucyrus NO BID Valk |[Esco Winter Equpment Razor No Guard System
Delivery Date 5 weeks ARO 30 Days ARO 14-21 days #SYS-RZ10NG

\Warranty vs flaws in workmanship/materials See Attached

(1 Right Hand & 1 Left Hand) End Protector

x 5" x 36" and 2 - .875” x 5" x 48”) Sets 3 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] $855.54 $2,566.62 $3,454.76 $10,364.28]
Brand Bid |[Kennametal NO BID NO BID XCAL Winter Equpment

Delivery Date 5 weeks ARO 6 Weeks ARO 14-21 days #SC-20160

W fl i #SC-20165

Scarifier End Protectors - Standard Duty
(1 Right Hand & 1 Left Hand) End Protector

5/8 inch (.625) Sets 5 $860.00 $4,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,261.54 $6,307.70 $0.00 $0.00
Brand Bid |[Kennametal NO BID NO BID XCAL NO BID

Delivery Date 5 weeks ARO 6 Weeks ARO

\Warranty vs flaws in workmanship/materials Mfg.

3/4 inch (.750) Sets 5 $860.00( $ 4,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,261.54 $6,307.70 $0.00 $0.00
Brand Bid |[Kennametal NO BID NO BID XCAL NO BID
Delivery Date 5 weeks ARO 6 Weeks ARO

W t

Grader Blades 34" x 8” x 7’ 5/8” diameter
bolt hole, standard highway punch, through-

fl

Mf

hardened Each 20 $143.00( $ 2,860.00 $0.00 $0.00] $170.00 $3,400.00 $174.75 $3,495.00 $0.00 $0.00]
Brand Bid [Black Cat NO BID Valk Esco NO BID

Delivery Date 1-2 days ARO (in stock) 30 Days ARO 6 Weeks ARO

Warranty vs breakage during normal usage See Attached Mifg.
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